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SUBJECT:

Bid on New and Replacement Floor Covering at Various Facilities




Award of Contract (EL-9)

PRESENTER:
Edward J. Fuentes, Deputy Superintendent




Bilingual Education and Human Resources Development



Curt Shaw, Director




Construction Management Department




RECOMMENDATION
That renewable contracts in the amount of $25,000, not to exceed $250,000, be awarded to the lowest qualified bidder for replacing the various floor coverings as required across the District.  

That a renewable contract in the amount of $25,000 be issued to Bagley’s Floor Services, Ltd., for the installation of Carpet Type 1, Carpet Type 5, Carpet Type 6, Vinyl Composition Tile, Vinyl Sheet Floorings, Rubber Floor Tile and Rubber Stair Tread as submitted under Bidder’s Proposal for Construction Contract.

That a renewable contract in the amount of $25,000 be issued to Accent Flooring, Inc., for the installation of Carpet Type 2, Carpet Type 3, Carpet Type 4, and Carpet Type 7 as submitted under Bidder’s Proposal for Construction Contract.

That a renewable contract in the amount of $25,000 be issued to Consolidated Specialty Products, Inc. for the installation of Taraflex Flooring as submitted under Bidder’s Proposal for Construction Contract.

That a renewable contract in the amount of $ 25,000 be issued to Austin Court and Floors, Inc., for the installation of Sport Court Flooring as submitted under Bidder’s Proposal for Construction Contract.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION
During the course of each budget year, the AISD Construction Management Department receives numerous requests from schools and other facilities for the replacement of various floor covering.  In order to expedite the timely completion of these numerous projects as they are identified, installed unit price bids were taken. This bid process eliminates the need to bid each project individually, thereby providing more flexibility in meeting certain school timelines and implementation requirements.

In order, to meet the varied and wide range of replacement floor covering requests, a total of three classifications of flooring were specified in the bid documents.

1.) Carpet Products:  for general use such as offices, classrooms and conference rooms Types 1, 2 and 3 were specified.  Types 1 and 2 are 26-oz. yarn weight and are a tufted product with thermoplastic backing.  Type 3 is a 26-oz. yarn weight, tufted product, with a polypropylene backing.  In areas where high soiling and foot traffic, like auditoriums and libraries, Types 4, 5 and 6 were specified.  Type 4 is a 20-oz. yarn weight, with a vinyl cushioned backing.  Types 5 and 6 are a 20-oz. tufted carpet with a thermoplastic backing.

In areas where highly repetitive and extreme soiling conditions exist, such as life skills rooms, daycare and pre-kindergarten rooms and common areas, Type 7 was specified.  Type 7 is 20-oz. carpet with a vinyl backing.

2.) Resilient Flooring Products:  for hard surface requirements in hallways, cafeterias and restrooms, vinyl composition tile, vinyl sheet flooring, and rubber tile products were specified.

3.) Specialty Gym Flooring:  for special gymnasium requirements where durability and maintenance are high priority Taraflex Sports Flooring was specified as a sole-source product.  Sports Court Flooring was specified as an alternate sole-source product.

Installed unit prices were solicited under these three classifications to increase the flexibility and quality of the projects with respect to existing conditions, specific use, color selection, availability and proper installation. 

Additionally, unit prices were taken for carpet removal and for disposal, and for flooring accessories such as rubber reducer strips and coved base.

Cobos & Associates prepared specifications for this floor covering work and bids were submitted to the AISD Office of Plant Improvements, Construction Management Department. The total estimated cost for the implementation of this replacement floor covering work is approximately $250,000, with an estimated timeline from January 2003 to September 2003.  This estimate is based on previous floor-covering work performed between May 2001 and September 2002, and took into consideration the funds available in the current maintenance and operations budget for the Construction Management Department.

Bagley’s Floor Services, Ltd., Accent Flooring, Inc., Consolidated Specialty Products, and Austin Courts and Floors, Inc., have successfully performed work for AISD in the past.  Austin Courts and Floors, Inc. (Sports Court Flooring) and Consolidated Specialty Products (Taraflex Flooring) are sole-source bidders for the two gym floor coverings. These projects will be funded from the AISD Construction Management Department’s annual maintenance and operations budget.

ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION

The project was publicly advertised according to state law and Board policy.  A formal bid opening was held on Monday, December 2, 2002, at 4:00 PM in the AISD Office of Construction Management.  A tabulation of the bids received is attached (Attachment A).

Bagley’s Floor Services, Ltd., was the overall lowest and most responsive bidder for Carpet Types 1, 5 and 6 and vinyl composition tile, vinyl sheet flooring, rubber floor tile and rubber stair tread.

Accent Floors, Inc., was the overall lowest and most responsive bidder for Carpet Types 2, 3, 4 and 7.

Consolidated Specialty Products submitted as a sole-source bidder for Taraflex Flooring.

Austin Courts and Floors, Inc. submitted as a sole-source bidder for Sports Court Flooring.

ACTION REQUIRED
Board approval.

CONTACT PERSONS



Edward J. Fuentes




Curt Shaw

Attachment A

	Bid Tab for New and Replacement Flooring
	
	
	
	
	
	

	at Various Schools Dec.2, 2002
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Low bid for replacement carpet installations:
	
	
	
	
	

	includes item number 9 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 
	
	Accent 
	Bagley's Floor
	Lone Star 
	Consolidated
	Austin Courts

	 
	
	Flooring
	Services
	 Carpet
	Specialty
	and Floors 

	
	
	
	
	
	 Products 
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 1 $/Sq.Yd.
	
	 $     21.95 
	 $              17.69 
	 $              23.85 
	 no bid 
	 no bid

	Type - 1  Carpet
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Lees Faculty Classics
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 2 $/Sq.Yd.
	
	 $     17.68 
	 $              19.13 
	 no bid 
	 no bid 
	no bid

	Type - 2 Carpet
	
	
	
	
	
	

	J & J Steadfast 26
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 3 $/Sq.Yd.
	
	 $     15.78 
	 $              18.31 
	 $              17.30 
	 no bid 
	no bid

	Type- 3 Carpet
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Shaw Tek, Illusions II; Ult Mp
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 4 $/Sq.Yd.
	
	 $     23.95 
	 $              27.21 
	 no bid  
	 no bid 
	no bid

	Type - 4 Carpet
	
	
	
	
	
	

	C & A Sentinel
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 5 $/Sq.Yd.
	
	 $     27.25 
	 $              23.44 
	 $              28.81 
	 no bid 
	no bid

	Type- 5  Carpet
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Lees Buildingworks
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No.6 $/Sq.Yd.
	
	 $     24.96 
	 $              20.81 
	 $              25.70 
	 no bid 
	no bid

	Type- 6 Carpet
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Lees Check- Up
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 7 $/Sq.Yd.
	
	 $     20.60 
	 no bid 
	 no bid 
	 no bid 
	no bid

	Type- 7 Carpet
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Interface Rain Forest
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Prices: Continued
	
	 Accent  
	 Bagley's Floor 
	 Lone Star 
	 Consolidated 
	Austin Courts

	
	
	 Floors 
	 Services 
	 Carpet 
	 Specialty 
	and Floors

	
	
	
	
	
	 Products 
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 8 $/Sq.Yd.
	
	 $     26.49 
	 $              30.00 
	 $              23.25 
	  no bid 
	no bid

	Type- 8 Carpet
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Shaw Tek, Academy II ETK 6
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 9 $/Sq.Yd.
	
	 $       0.75 
	 $                1.25 
	 $                1.50 
	 $              9.00 
	no bid

	Removal and disposal of existing carpet -
	
	
	
	
	
	

	includes removal of vinyl base and 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	accessories.
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 10  $/Ln.Ft.
	
	 $       0.85 
	 $                0.76 
	 $                1.75 
	 no bid 
	no bid

	Rubber reducer strip; Roppe Series; 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	one inch wide 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 11 $/Ln.Ft.
	
	 $       0.89 
	 $               0.84 
	 $                1.00 
	  no bid 
	no bid

	Coved Base ;  Roppe 700 series
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 12 $/Sq. Ft.
	
	 $       1.15 
	 $                1.04 
	 $                1.05 
	 no bid 
	no bid

	Vinyl Composition Tile 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Armstrong Standard Excelon
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 13 $/Sq.Yard
	
	 $     30.98 
	 $              28.58 
	 $              31.50 
	 no bid 
	no bid

	Vinyl Sheet Flooring 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Armstrong; Medintech
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No. 14 $/ Sq. Yard
	
	 $     22.87 
	 $              18.91 
	 $              20.85 
	  no bid 
	no bid

	Vinyl Sheet Flooring
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Armstrong; Classic Corlon
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 
	
	   
	   
	   
	   
	 

	 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Prices Continued:
	
	 Accent  
	 Bagley's Floor 
	 Lone Star 
	 Consolidated 
	Austin Courts

	
	
	 Floors 
	 Services 
	 Carpet 
	 Specialty  
	and Floors

	
	
	
	
	
	 Products 
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No 15 $ /Sq. Ft.
	
	 $       7.10 
	 $                5.82 
	 no bid 
	 no bid 
	no bid

	Rubber Floor Tile- Endura 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Low Profile round pattern
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No 16 $ / Sq. Ft.
	
	 $     11.09 
	 $              10.16 
	 no bid 
	no bid
	no bid

	Rubber Stair Tread; Endura ; Low profile 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	round pattern
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No 17/ $ Sq.Ft.
	
	N/A
	N/A
	N/A
	 $              6.08 
	N/A

	Taraflex Sports Flooring; Sport M Maple  
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Design M ; Sole Source Bid
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Voluntary Alternate Sole Source Bid
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Unit Price No 19 / $ Sq. Ft.
	
	N/A
	N/A
	N/A
	N/A
	 $               6.50 

	Sport Court Flooring; Response 6.0
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Alternate Sole Source Bid
	
	
	
	
	
	


