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SUBJECT:

Portable Strategy and Award of Contracts for the Relocation of 19 or More Existing Portable Classroom Buildings and Associated Electrical, Plumbing, Technical Wiring, Sidewalk and Porch Construction Award of Contract (EL9)

PRESENTER:
Edward J. Fuentes, Deputy Superintendent




Bilingual Education and Human Resources Development

Curt Shaw, Director




Construction Management




RECOMMENDATION



That the Board of Trustees adopt the following recommendations for the relocation/remodeling of existing portable classroom buildings and for the possible construction of new portables for the 2003-2004 school year:



1) Award the following contracts to the respective low bidders and     subsequent low bidders for lump sum and unit price bids taken for the relocation of 19 portable classroom buildings and associated electrical, plumbing, technology wiring, sidewalk and porch construction:


Physical Moves:



Award 19 moves (Bid Item Nos. 1, 2, 3 and 4) to the low, qualified bidder, Harris House Moving Contractors, in the amount of  $85,137.00.




Total for moving 19 Portables


$85,137












Concrete Sidewalks and Carpentry:



Award seven portables (Bid Item Nos. 1 and 2) to the low qualified bidder, Lakewood Construction Co., in the amount of $24,500



Award two portables (Bid Item No. 3) to the low qualified bidder, Industrial Laminates Corporation, in the amount of $58,658.     (This Bid Item includes the refurbishing of an older portable as well as providing new aluminum ramps and decks.)



Award five portables (Bid Item No. 4) to the low qualified bidder, TOFKA, Inc., in the amount of $39,880.


Award 5 portables (Bid Item No. 5) to the second low, qualified bidder, Garcia General Construction, in the amount of $23,830.




Total Sidewalks and Carpentry


$146,868 


Water and Wastewater Connections:



Award nine portables (Bid Item Nos. 1, 2, 5, 6, 7 and 8) to the low qualified bidder, A & L Plumbing, in the amount of $17,900.



Award three portables (Bid Item Nos. 3 and 4) to the low qualified bidder, Ray Wendland Construction, in the amount of $8,600.




Total Water and Wastewater Connections
$26,500



Electrical Services:



Award 13 portables (Bid Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 12 and 13) to the low qualified bidder, John Mitchell Electric, in the amount of  $4,160.



Award three portables (Bid Item Nos. 6 and 14) to the low qualified bidder, Crouch/KST, in the amount of $400.



Award three portables (Bid Item Nos. 10 and 11) to the second low qualified bidder, Crouch/KST, in the amount of $775.00.



Total Electrical Services



$ 5,335



Technology Infrastructure:


Award 15 portables (Bid Item No. 1, 2 and 3) to the low, qualified bidder, Avnet, in the amount of  $23,308.



Award five portables (Bid Item No. 4) to the second low, qualified bidder, Co Com Cabling Systems, in the amount of  $11,400.



Total Technology Infrastructure


$  34,708



     Total Amount of all Awards

         
$298,548


New Portable Construction:




There are no recommendations for an award of contract to construct new portables at this time.  In the event that new portables are required, a separate agenda will be brought to the Board of Trustee recommending that a contract be awarded to the lowest, qualified bidder, TOFKA, Inc. or ILCOR based on unit price items.



2) That the requirement for Board award of contracts in the amount of     $50,000 or more be waived for the relocation/remodeling of existing portables and the construction of new portables that may be required in excess of the original bid awards.  Awards for subsequent portable construction, moves, sidewalks and carpentry, water and sewer connections, technology wiring and electrical service will be based on the lowest combination of unit prices submitted in each original bid proposal for each of the trades as required at the selected sites and the contractor’s ability to complete the required work within AISD’s time schedule.


                      3) That these procedures shall apply to the initial contract awards and all additional portable requirements determined to be necessary after the initial awards, and that these waivers remain in effect throughout the 2003-2004 school year.


BACKGROUND INFORMATION





Preliminary enrollment projections projects indicate a need to relocate 19 existing portables.  One is an older portable requiring asbestos abatement that will be relocated from Porter Middle School to Paredes Middle School. This portable will have new exterior wall panels installed and be completely refinished on the inside. 




All work associated with the portables will be funded from the annual maintenance and operations budget of the Construction Management Department.




In summary, the final bid solicitation included bid items for the relocation of 19 existing portables from one campus to another.  The only exception was the technology wiring solicitation where bids were taken for the relocation of 20 portables.  Unit prices were also solicited for the construction and relocation/remodeling of additional portables as required during the period from May 30, 2003 to December 31, 2003, with the  option to extend the bid prices into 2004 if agreeable to both parties.  (See attached bid tabulations “A” through “F” for a complete listing of bid items).




As verified by past portable construction and relocation efforts, the Construction Management, Financial Services and Materials Management departments have recognized the need to modify certain Board policies on contract awards if the portable classrooms are to be ready for occupancy by August 1, 2003.  The same policy modifications that the Board approved in 2002-2003 will need to be approved for 2003-2004 to ensure timely completion of the portable work this year.




ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION



AISD Construction Management anticipates the need to relocate 19 existing portables prior to the beginning of the 2003-2004 school year. In the event that additional portables have to be constructed and relocated to respond to revised actual school enrollments and other space needs, contracts will be awarded as proposed in this strategy based on lowest, qualified unit prices.



  
Each year, the Associate Director of Planning Services and the area superintendents plan the most cost-effective allocation of portable classrooms.  Early estimates are given for portable needs and portables to be released as soon as the projected enrollment for the following fall is available.  Revisions of these initial estimates are made throughout the spring as requests are received from campuses, principals are notified of the anticipated number of portables to be released and refinements are made in the projected membership.  These refinements result in modifications in the anticipated location of these portables.  Information must be available before May in order to have portables in place for the opening of school. Historically, some additional requests have occurred after the beginning of school in order to address needs related to unanticipated growth or program relocation.



   As the portable needs are identified for the fall semester, the following priorities are used in making decisions about the allocation and location of portable buildings.  




•
Student use always has priority over adult use.




•
Classroom use typically has priority over support use.




•
Classroom and other support uses always have priority over discretionary use.




•
Where home school assignment is not educationally or economically feasible, district requirements to serve special needs students will have priority in the allocation of space.




•
Secondary classroom schedules should maximize the use of classroom space and meet pre-identified efficiency targets to qualify for additional space.




•
For 2003-2004, classroom uses were assumed to include:





      Elementary – homeroom classes, special needs classes for home-based and assigned special needs students, and special area computer labs.





      Secondary – rooms for courses within the approved state and local curriculum.





Once allocations and locations have been identified in late spring for the fall student enrollment projections, the portable movement and construction process is bid in both lump sum and unit price packages in order to facilitate timely completion of the portables needed prior to the start of school.  Completion has been achieved successfully for the last 17 years.

                                 The finalized requests outlined above are made in late spring and given to the AISD Construction Management Department with little time left for Board approval of any other than the initial contract awards such that construction can begin by June 5, 2003.  If any subsequent requests are necessary after the start of classes in the fall, they are usually even more urgent since they are made in response to the unexpected actual enrollment increases and require immediate action to alleviate overcrowding that can have negative impacts on instruction.  In order to accomplish the portable relocation and/or construction effort this year, the Board of Trustees needs to approve waivers to the existing Board policy contract awards to permit the following:



1) Initial construction and relocation contracts, based on qualified low bids, would be issued to successful bidders.



    2) Inasmuch as the number of portables required or amount of work required may be greater than any one contractor could manage within the available timeframe, AISD Construction Management needs to be able to contract as much work as the lowest, qualified bidder would be capable of completing and make additional awards to the next lowest, qualified bidders as necessary.



    3) The work has been advertised in accordance with Board policy and state law, a public bid opening has been conducted, and contract award recommendations are now being presented to the Board for approval. Following the initial bid awards, the administration needs a waiver of the normal requirement for Board award of construction contracts in excess of $50,000 such that subsequent awards for additional portables and associated work can be made, based upon unit price bids received, without returning to the Board for approval.




Granting of the above waivers would allow the AISD Construction Management Department to accelerate procedures required for the award and initiation of work during the ten weeks of time allocated for making portables ready for occupancy prior to the fall, 2003 semester and to facilitate the relocation of additional portables needed during the course of the school year.  





Plans and specifications for the work were prepared by the AISD Construction Management Department.  The projects were advertised as required by Board policy and state law, and bids were received on April 28, 2003 and April 29, 2003.   Tabulations of the various bids received are shown on Attachments “A”, “B”, “C”, “D”, “E” & “F”.




A summary of the bid results and observations relative to those results for each of the areas of work is presented as follows:




NEW PORTABLES (Attachment “A”)




TOFKA, Inc. was low bidder on the unit price solicitations for constructing additional portables (Unit Price Nos.1, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 7), should the need arise.




ILCOR was low bidder on the unit price solicitations for constructing additional portables (Unit Price No. 6), should the need arise. 




It is not anticipated that any new portables will be required for the 2003-2004 school year.  In the event that new portables are required, due to changing needs, actual awards for construction will be based upon the lowest combination of unit price bids for the portable (base bid), its porches or ramps, its sidewalks and its utility lines (unit prices) at the selected site.  The contractor’s ability to complete the work within AISD’s time schedule will also be a factor.




RELOCATION OF PORTABLES

  


Physical Moves - (Attachment “B”)



Harris House Moving was low bidder on the relocation of 19 portables (Bid Item Nos. 1, 2, 3 and 4) and the unit prices for subsequent moves.




Using the low bids, the total amount of contract awards for the relocation of portables is $85,137.



Concrete Sidewalks & Carpentry - (Attachment “C”)




Lakewood Construction Co. was low bidder on the sidewalks and carpentry for 12 portables to be relocated (Bid Item Nos. 1, 2, and 5). Performance and payment bond requirements limit the amount of work that can be awarded in a single contract to Lakewood Construction Co. to less than $25,000, allowing only seven portables to be awarded.




Due to Lakewood Construction Co. bonding limitations, staff recommends that low bidder, Lakewood Construction Co. be awarded seven portables (Bid Items Nos. 1 and 2) and second low bidder, Garcia General Construction, be awarded five portables (Bid Items Nos. 5).

TOFKA, Inc. was the low, qualified bidder on 5 portables (Bid Item No. 4).

Industrial Laminates Corporation was the low qualified bidder on two portables, including the portable to be refurbished (Bid Item No. 3). 




Using the low bids and subsequent low bids for each bid, the total of the contracts awarded for the sidewalks and carpentry for relocated portables is $146,868.




Water and Sewer Connections - (Attachment “D”)




A & L Plumbing was low bidder on nine portables (Bid Item Nos. 1, 2, 5, 6, 7 and 8).




Ray Wendland Construction was low bidder on three portables (Bid Item Nos. 3 and 4). 



The total of the contracts awarded, at this time, for the water and sewer connections for relocated portables is $26,500.



Electrical Service - (Attachment “E”)



John Mitchell Electric was low bidder on 16 portables (Bid Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12 and 13). Due to the short time frame for completing these portables, staff recommends that three of these portables (Bid Items Nos. 10 and 11) be awarded to second low bidder, Crouch/KST.



Crouch/KST was low bidder on three portables (Bid Item Nos. 6 and 14). 



The total of the contracts awarded for the electrical service connections for relocated portables is $5,335.




Technology Infrastructure - (Attachment “F”)




Avnet was the low, qualified bidder on 20 portables (Bid Item Nos. 1, 2, 3 and 4). Due to the short timeframe for completing these portables staff recommends that five of these portables (Bid Items No. 4) be awarded to second low bidder, Co Com Cabling Systems .



Using the low bid, the total of the contract awarded for the technology infrastructure is $34,708.



The total amount of contract awards for the relocation of the 19 portables is $298,548.




Actual awards for subsequent portable moves, sidewalks and carpentry, water and sewer connections, electrical service and technology infrastructure will be based upon the lowest combination of unit prices for each of the trades as required at the selected sites and the contractor’s ability to complete the required work within AISD’s time schedule.




ACTION REQUIRED



Board approval.




CONTACT PERSONS




Edward Fuentes




Curt Shaw




Hector Hinojosa



BID TABULATIONS

ARCHITECT:







PROJECT:






BID OPENING:

Hector O. Hinojosa






New Portable Classrooms





Monday, April 28, 2003

             








Buildings






2:30 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.

	
CONTRACTOR
	
BID


BOND
	Add.


	UNIT PRICE #1
	UNIT PRICE #2
	UNIT PRICE #3
	UNIT PRICE #4
	UNIT PRICE #5
	UNIT PRICE #6
	UNIT

 PRICE #7
	
	*
	*

	GENERAL MODULAR
	No Bid
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	ILCOR


	Yes
	Yes
	80,447
	61,108
	71,312
	70,713
	51,549
	86,484
	63,498
	

	TOFKA, INC.


	Yes
	Yes
	69,480
	54,860
	63,280
	62,860
	47,880
	86,880
	61,880
	

	VANGUARD MODULAR


	Rental Prices only
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	W.S. WALKER


	No Bid
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BID TABULATIONS

ARCHITECT:






PROJECT:





BID OPENING:

Hector O. Hinojosa





New Portable Classroom




Monday, April 28, 2003

                                                                                                            
Buildings





2:30 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.

	CONTRACTOR
	ALUMINUM PORCHES
	CONCRETE SIDEWALKS
	

	
	UNIT PRICE #1
	UNIT PRICE #2
	UNIT PRICE #3
	UNIT PRICE #4
	UNIT PRICE #1
	UNIT PRICE #2
	UNIT PRICE #3
	UNIT

 PRICE #4
	

	GENERAL MODULAR


	No Bid
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	ILCOR


	5,575
	1,140
	8,868
	1,604  1,822  2,040
	5.25
	4
	5
	75
	

	TOFKA, INC.


	5,880
	1,280
	8,380
	1,080  1,480  1,880
	3.95
	3.85
	3.95
	185
	

	VANGUARD MODULAR


	No Bid
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	W.S. WALKER


	No Bid
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


BID TABULATIONS

ARCHITECT:






PROJECT:






BID OPENING:

Hector O. Hinojosa





Relocation of






Monday, April 28, 2003

             






Portable Classroom Units





1:00 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.

	
CONTRACTOR
	
BID


BOND
	ADD.

#1
	BID ITEM #1

4 Portables
	BID ITEM #2

4 Portables
	BID ITEM #3

5 Portables
	BID ITEM #4

3 Portables
	BID ITEM #5

3 Portables
	
	
	

	A&R Demolition 


	Yes
	Yes
	24,000
	26,000
	26,900
	23,900
	23,000
	
	
	

	Brown & Son
	Yes
	Yes
	23,600
	24,000


	30,500


	18,300


	18,000


	
	
	

	Harris House Moving


	Yes
	Yes
	16,996
	19,749


	21,245


	12,747


	14,400


	
	
	

	Rawhide House        Moving 
	Yes
	Yes
	21,000
	40,000


	65,000


	18,000


	24,000


	
	
	

	Richard Harris House Moving


	Yes
	Yes
	22,900
	24,890


	33,870


	18,790


	18,990


	
	
	

	Roger Faglie House Moving (ILCOR)


	Yes
	Yes
	21,072
	21,072
	26,340
	15,804
	15,804
	
	
	

	West Texas House Movers
	Yes
	Yes
	21,000
	22,000
	26,000
	16,000
	16,000


	
	
	


CONTINUED - Page 2.

Hector Hinojosa







Relocation of





Monday, April 28, 2003

             







Portable Classroom Units



1:00 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.
	
CONTRACTOR
	
	Unit Bid

Item  # 1 Campus to Campus
	Unit Bid

Item # 1A On-Site
	Unit Bid

Item # 2 CMU 
	Unit Bid

Item # 3 Concrete footings Removal
	Unit Bid

Item # 4 Credit for Anchors
	Unit Bid

Item # 5 Concrete Sidewalk Removal
	Unit Bid

Item # 6 8’x16 Aluminum Deck
	Unit Bid

Item #7     12’ x 16’ Aluminum Deck

_________

 Unit Price

#7

	
	
	Unit Price 

     # 1
	Unit Price # 1A
	Unit Price

# 2
	Unit Price

# 3
	Unit Price # 4

      (Credit)
	Unit Price

#5
	Unit Price

        #6
	

	A&R Demolition 


	
	
	5,600
	4,800
	2.95
	800
	60
	1.45
	14,000
	19,000

	Brown & Son
	
	
	6,500
	6,000


	2


	800


	50


	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Harris House Moving
	
	
	4,220
	4,220


	9


	1,900


	0.50


	4.50
	12,500
	14,500

	Rawhide House        Moving 
	
	
	4,666
	4,444.44


	3.88


	2,088


	5.55


	2
	8,488
	10,088

	Richard Harris House Moving


	
	
	5,390
	5,090


	9


	2,250


	10


	1.90
	20,000
	25,000

	Roger Faglie House Moving (ILCOR)


	
	5,268
	5,268
	2
	1,500
	0
	5.50
	8,868
	10,815
	

	West Texas House Movers
	
	5,300
	4,600
	5
	500
	200
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	


BID TABULATIONS


ARCHITECT:






PROJECT:






BID OPENING:

Hector O. Hinojosa





Concrete Sidewalks & Carpentry




Wednesday, April 30, 2003

             







Portable Classroom Units





2:00 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.

	
CONTRACTOR
	BID

BOND
	ADD.


	BID ITEM

 #1


	BID ITEM

 #2


	BID ITEM 

#3


	BID ITEM

 #4


	BID ITEM

 #5


	Unit Price

No. 1

Portable  w/ Wood Deck 
	Unit Price No.2

Portable  w/ Aluminum Deck
	

	Bricon
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	ILCOR
	YES
	YES
	23,000
	12,000
	58,658
	51,150
	30,715
	4,100
	13,200
	

	Jentsch Construction
	YES
	YES
	23,000
	18,000
	60,000
	50,000
	24,980
	3,980
	14,000
	

	Lakewood Construction
	YES
	YES
	16,600
	7,900
	NO BID
	NO BID
	22,200
	3,900
	10,830
	

	Quality Concrete
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Rawhide House Moving
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Reyes Construction Co.
	YES
	YES
	NO BID
	NO BID
	80,000
	NO BID
	24,000
	11,000
	NO BID
	

	TOFKA Inc.
	YES
	YES
	18,880
	9,380
	59,880
	39,880
	25,880
	4,188
	10,980
	

	Total Home Care Services
	BID NOT ACCEPTED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	W.S. Walker Co. Inc.
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Garcia Construction
	YES
	YES
	18,000
	14,000
	75,000
	65,000
	23,830
	3,100
	12,200
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


CONTINUED - Page 2.

Hector O. Hinojosa





Concrete Sidewalks & Carpentry



Wednesday, April 30, 2003

             







Portable Classroom Units




2:00 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.
	
CONTRACTOR
	Wood Decks & Ramps



	
	Unit Price 

# 3

5’x 5 deck
	Unit Price

 # 4

5’ wide step
	Unit Price

 # 5
Lin Ft 4’ wide Ramp
	Unit Price

 # 6

Lin Ft 5’ wide Ramp 
	Unit Price 

# 7
8’ x 16’ Deck
	Unit Price      # 8

12’ x 16’ Deck
	

	Bricon
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	

	ILCOR
	450
	55
	44
	55
	1,400
	2,100
	

	Jentsch Construction
	400
	75
	65
	60
	1,500
	2,000
	

	Lakewood Construction
	300
	90
	40
	45
	1,200
	1,400
	

	Quality Concrete
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Rawhide House Moving
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Reyes Construction Co.
	700
	90
	80
	60
	1,100
	1,500
	

	TOFKA Inc.
	480
	95
	45
	46
	1,180
	1,480
	

	Total Home Care Services
	BID NOT ACCEPTED
	
	
	
	
	
	

	W.S. Walker Co.
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Garcia Construction
	310
	55
	48
	55
	1,300
	1,500
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


CONTINUED – Page 3

Hector O. Hinojosa





Concrete Sidewalks & Carpentry



Wednesday, April 30, 2003

             







Portable Classroom Units




2:00 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.
	
CONTRACTOR
	Aluminum Decks & Ramps



	
	Unit Price 

# 9

8’ x 8’ Deck
	Unit Price

 # 10

8’ x 16’ Deck
	Unit Price

 # 11
12’ x 16’ Deck
	
	
	
	

	Bricon
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	

	ILCOR
	6,400
	9,810
	12,475
	
	
	
	

	Jentsch Construction
	11,000
	13,000
	19,000
	
	
	
	

	Lakewood Construction
	5,850
	8,390
	9,980
	
	
	
	

	Quality Concrete
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Rawhide House Moving
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Reyes Construction Co.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	
	
	
	

	TOFKA Inc.
	6,180
	8,380
	10,480
	
	
	
	

	Total Home Care Services
	BID NOT ACCEPTED
	
	
	
	
	
	

	W.S. Walker Co.
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Garcia Construction
	8,500
	10,000
	12,980
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


CONTINUED - Page 4

Hector O. Hinojosa





Concrete Sidewalks & Carpentry



Wednesday, April 30, 2003

             







Portable Classroom Units




2:00 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.

	
CONTRACTOR
	Concrete Sidewalks



	29 Ga. Skirting


/linear ft.
	Remove & Install new Skirting

Per Portable
	Foundation

Vents
	3’ Rigid Floor Insulation/ bldg.
	Painting

2 Entry Doors
	Painting

Window Guards

	
	Unit Price

# 12

<350 S.F.
	Unit Price # 13

>351 S.F.
	Unit Price

# 14
Bridge
	Unit Price

# 15
Demolition
	Unit Price

# 16
	Unit Price

# 17
	Unit Price

# 18
	Unit Price

# 19
	Unit Price

# 20
	Unit Price

# 21

	Bricon
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	ILCOR
	5
	4
	75
	5
	2.75
	2,400
	2,400
	3,500
	400
	750

	Jentsch Construction
	7.50
	3.75
	80
	3
	1.80
	1,800
	650
	3,000
	500
	800

	Lakewood Construction
	3.50
	2.85
	90
	3
	1.50
	1,250
	560
	2,100
	300
	400

	Quality Concrete
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Rawhide House Moving
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Reyes Construction Co.
	4.50
	4.50
	150
	4.50
	1.75
	1,400
	1,610
	2,200
	330
	600

	TOFKA Inc.
	3.88
	3.28
	98
	3.48
	1.85
	1,780
	580
	2,380
	288
	488

	Total Home Care Services
	BID NOT ACCEPTED
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	W.S. Walker Co. Inc.
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Garcia Construction
	5
	3.10
	50
	2
	1.65
	1,200
	500
	2,500
	300
	500


CONTINUED - Page 5.

Hector O. Hinojosa





Concrete Sidewalks & Carpentry



Wednesday, April 30, 2003

             







Portable Classroom Units




2:00 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.

	
CONTRACTOR
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	Painting Non-slip Unit Price 

# 22
	Reversing of Doors Unit Price 

#23
	ConversionElem to Sec Unit Price

# 24
	Conversion Sec to Elem Unit Price

# 25
	Conversion to HC Toilet    Unit Price

# 26
	Exterior Door Unit Price

# 27
	Interior Door Unit Price

# 28
	Interior Wall Unit Price

# 29
	Casework Unit Price

# 30
	Window Guards   Unit Price

# 31
	Gutters & Downspouts Unit Price

# 32

	Bricon
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	ILCOR
	450
	750
	2,000
	30,000
	29,775
	3,905
	1,025
	3,600
	200
	1,250
	450

	Jentsch Construction
	400
	500
	1,200
	24,000
	24,000
	3,000
	1,500
	2,800
	500
	1,800
	5

	Lakewood Construction
	250
	250
	750
	19,900
	14,900
	2,100
	750
	2,100
	90
	1,200
	560

	Quality Concrete
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Rawhide House Moving
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Reyes Construction Co.
	350
	280
	3,000
	72,000
	26,000
	3,000
	750
	2,600
	600
	1,200
	1,000



	TOFKA Inc.
	288
	288
	788
	18,080
	12,880
	1,880
	880
	2,280
	98
	1,388
	688



	Total Home Care Services
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	W.S. Walker Co. Inc.
	NO BID
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Garcia Construction
	200
	300
	800
	23,000
	20,000
	2,300
	1,000
	2,500
	300
	1,500
	420



BID TABULATIONS

ARCHITECT:






PROJECT:





BID OPENING:

Hector Hinojosa/






Water and Sewer Connections to 



Monday, April 28, 2003

Frank Tomasek






Portable Classroom Buildings



2:00 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.

	
CONTRACTOR
	BID

BOND
	
ADD.

#1 #2  #3
	
BID ITEM


#1
	
BID ITEM


#2
	
BID ITEM


#3
	
BID ITEM


#4
	
BID ITEM


#5
	
BID ITEM


#6
	
BID ITEM


#7
	
BID ITEM


#8

	A& L Pluming
	X
	X
	
	
	2700.00
	3200.00
	5800.00
	3800.00
	3200.00
	3300.00
	2800.00
	2700.00

	A-Texan Plumbing
	No Bid
	
	
	
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Ray Wendland
	X
	X
	
	
	3050.00
	5600.00
	5600.00
	3000.00
	3350.00
	3350.00
	3700.00
	2950.00

	Standford Odanga
	No Bid
	
	
	
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	.
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	.
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BID TABULATIONS

ARCHITECT:






PROJECT:




BID OPENING:

Hector Hinojosa/





Water and Sewer Connections to 


Monday, April 28, 2003

Frank Tomasek





Portable Classroom Buildings


2:00 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.
	
CONTRACTOR
	BID ITEM #9
	BID ITEM

#10
	
UNIT PRICE # 1
	UNIT PRICE # 2

	
	
	
	-50'
	+50'
	1"PVC
	1-1/2'PVC
	2"PVC
	ROCK
	+50’

1” PVC
	+50’

1-1/2” PVC
	+50’

2” PVC

	A& L Pluming
	
	
	10.00
	10.00
	7.00
	9.50
	9.50
	10.00
	7.00
	9.50
	9.50

	A- Texan Plumbing
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Ray Wendland
	
	
	15.00
	15.00
	7.50
	9.25
	9.75
	15.00
	7.50
	9.00
	9.00

	Standford Odanga
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
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BID TABULATIONS

ARCHITECT:






PROJECT:




BID OPENING:

Hector Hinojosa/





Water and Sewer Connections to 


Monday, April 28, 2003

Frank Tomasek





Portable Classroom Buildings


2:00 P.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.
	
CONTRACTOR
	UNIT PRICE # 3
	UNIT PRICE # 4
	UNIT PRICE # 5


	UNIT PRICE #6
	UNIT PRICE #7

	
	2" 

PVC
	4" 

PVC
	4"

PVC
	6"

PVC
	ROCK
	+50' 

4"PVC
	+50'

6"PVC
	
	ROCK
	SOIL
	WATER  /

WASTE WATER

	A& L Pluming
	9.00
	10.00
	14.00
	24.00
	15.00
	14.00
	20.00
	1,280.00
	1,900.00
	950.00
	800.00

	A- Texan Plumbing
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Ray  Wendland
	15.00
	17.50
	11.50
	14.00
	20.00
	11.75
	18.00
	1675.00
	1750.00
	900.00
	800.00

	Standford Odanga
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


BID TABULATIONS

ARCHITECT:



PROJECT:







BID OPENING:

Hector Hinojosa/


Electric Service to Existing





Monday, April 28, 2003

Frank Tomasek


Portable Classroom Buildings




10:30 A.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.

	
CONTRACTOR
	BID

BOND
	
ADD.

#1    #2   #3
	
BID ITEM


#1
	
BID ITEM


#2
	
BID ITEM


#3
	
BID ITEM


#4
	
BID ITEM


#5
	
BID ITEM


#6
	
BID ITEM


#7
	
BID ITEM


#8

	A.M. Electrical
	No Bid
	
	
	
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Crouch/ KST
	X
	X
	
	
	350.00
	700.00
	350.00
	350.00
	700.00
	250.00
	350.00
	350.00

	John Mitchel Electric
	X
	X
	
	
	320.00


	640.00


	320.00


	320.00


	640.00


	520.00


	320.00


	320.00

	Lake Electric
	X
	X
	
	
	350.00


	700.00
	350.00
	350.00
	700.00
	700.00
	350.00
	350.00

	Sun* Tech Electric
	X
	X
	
	
	347.00


	694.00
	347.00
	347.00
	694.00
	710.00
	347.00
	347.00

	W.K. Jennings Electric
	X
	X


	
	
	398.00


	796.00
	398.00


	398.00


	796.00


	930.00


	398.00


	398.00
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Hector Hinojosa/
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Monday, April 28, 2003

Frank Tomasek


Portable Classroom Buildings




10:30 A.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.
	
CONTRACTOR
	BID ITEM

#9
	BID ITEM

#10
	BID ITEM

#11
	BID ITEM

#12
	BID ITEM

#13
	BID ITEM

#14
	
	
	

	A.M. Electrical
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid 
	No Bid
	No Bid
	
	
	

	Crouch/KST
	700.00
	500.00
	275.00
	350.00
	350.00
	150.00
	
	
	

	John Mitchell  Electric
	640.00


	470.00


	260.00


	320.00


	320.00


	150.00


	
	
	

	Lake Electric
	700.00
	505.00
	350.00
	350.00
	350.00
	155.00
	
	
	

	Sun*Tech Electric
	694.00
	532.00
	365.00
	347.00
	347.00
	185.00
	
	
	

	W.K. Jennings Electric
	796.00


	572.00


	379.00


	398.00


	398.00


	174.00
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10:30 A.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.
	
CONTRACTOR
	
UNIT PRICE


#1
	
UNIT PRICE


#2
	UNIT PRICE

        #3
	
UNIT PRICE


#4
	
UNIT PRICE


#5
	UNIT PRICE


#6
	UNIT PRICE


#7
	UNIT PRICE


#8
	UNIT PRICE


#9

	A.M Electrical
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Crouch/KST
	150.00
	275.00
	250.00
	350.00
	1,000.00
	1,250.00
	800.00
	1,300.00
	6.00

	John Mitchell  Electric
	150.00
	260.00
	260.00
	320.00
	620.00
	620.00
	495.00
	670.00
	5.90

	Lake Electric
	155.00
	350.00
	350.00
	350.00
	650.00
	650.00
	650.00
	795.00
	5.75

	.Sun*Tech Electric
	185.00
	365.00
	355.00
	347.00
	660.00
	685.00
	620.00
	685.00
	6.90

	W.K. Jennings Electric
	174.00
	379.00
	465.00
	398.00
	705.00
	915.00
	545.00
	1,260.00
	6.50
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10:30 A.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.
	
CONTRACTOR
	UNIT PRICE


#10
	
UNIT PRICE


#11
	
UNIT PRICE


#12
	
UNIT PRICE


#13
	
UNIT PRICE


#14
	No. of

Portables
	

	
	

	A.M. Electrical
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid
	
	
	

	Crouch/KST
	450.00
	550.00
	275.00
	150.00
	225.00
	All
	
	
	

	John Mitchell Electric
	390.00
	525.00
	302.00
	300.00
	225.00
	60
	
	
	

	Lake Electric
	380.00
	490.00
	200.00
	325.00
	220.00
	20 +
	
	
	

	.Sun*Tech Electric
	650.00
	1,005.00
	205.00
	340.00
	190.00
	All
	
	
	

	W.K. Jennings Electric
	675.00
	575.00
	196.00
	335.00
	225.00
	All
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ARCHITECT:






PROJECT:





BID OPENING:
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Technology Infrastructure for




Monday, April 28, 2003

Portable Classroom Buildings



             11:30 A.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.

	BID ITEMS
	CONTRACTORS

	
	AVNET
	CO COM
	PRO INFO
	

	Bid Item No. 1
	7,043
	19,000
	23,799.50


	

	Bid Item No. 2
	10,195
	19,000


	34,500
	

	Bid Item No. 3
	6,070
	11,400


	23,799.50
	

	Bid Item No. 4
	9,405


	11,400
	23,799.50
	

	UNIT PRICE ITEMS
	
	
	
	

	1a
	Interior Portable

(New conduit)
	1,375
	2,400
	1,399.50
	

	1b
	Interior Portable

(Existing conduit)
	1,070
	2,400
	1,375.50
	

	2a
	Exterior Portable

(Drop from pole)
	480
	1,400
	525
	

	2b
	New IDF 

(On pole w/drop)
	475
	1,800
	1,875
	

	3a
	350 feet

(EIDF to Portable)
	2,530
	2,840
	3,495
	

	3b
	Cost/ linear foot of wiring
	4.61
	3.40
	10
	

	3c
	Cost /30’ pole
	420
	415
	599
	

	4
	Cost / man hour for additional work
	28
	21
	25
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BID TABULATIONS

Hector Hinojosa





Technology Infrastructure for





Monday, April 28, 2003

                                                                                         

 Portable Classroom Buildings



            
11:30 A.M., Const. Mgmt. Dept.

	
	UNIT PRICE ITEMS
	AVNET
	CO COM
	PRO INFO
	

	5a
	150 linear foot of

24 strand fiber
	850
	1,630
	2,267
	

	5b
	Cost/ linear foot of

24 strand fiber 
	780
	3.15
	15.10
	

	6a
	150 linear foot for

50 pair copper STP
	635
	850
	900
	

	6b
	Cost/ linear foot of

50 pair copper
	10.25
	5.65
	6
	

	7a
	150 linear foot of

 25 pair STP
	5.25
	650
	900
	

	7b
	Cost / linear foot of

 25 pair STP
	180
	4.30
	6
	

	8a
	150 linear foot of

500 TV cable
	175
	600
	1,325.50
	

	8b
	Cost/ linear foot of

500 TV cable
	1.75
	4
	9.05
	

	9
	Cost/19” Rack 
	135
	175
	180
	

	10
	External enclosure box
	240
	200
	2,270
	

	11
	Cost/wall sleeve


	75
	125
	150
	

	12
	Cost/concrete slab sleeve
	75
	300
	240
	

	13
	Disconnect/portable
	110
	150
	250
	

	14
	400 linear foot

telephone wire
	150
	500
	250
	

	15
	AVAYA Patch Panel
	280
	280
	500
	

	16
	AVAYA Fiber Panel
	151
	425
	500
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